
Where

To address long-standing
and recent challenges,
including placement
disruptions and high-
acuity youth in foster care
sleeping in local offices or
other unsuitable locations,
Governor Youngkin
launched the Safe and
Sound Task Force on 
April 1, 2022.  

End the
problem of
youth in
foster care
sleeping in
offices

Address
underlying
root causes
and
foundational
issues
Long term the Task Force
seeks to identify and
address underlying root
causes and foundational
issues contributing to the
problem 

Solution-
OrientedMulti-

system,
multi-
sector

C O N T A C T  H E A L T H A N D H U M A N R E S O U R C E S @ G O V E R N O R . V I R G I N I A . G O V
O R  Y O U R  L O C A L  D S S  T O  G E T  I N V O L V E D

The Task Force brings
together state, local,
and private partners for
a multi-system
approach because these
are “all of our kids” and a
coordinated, aligned
response is necessary

We are using new and
existing services,
models, programs, and
ideas to resolve the
problem and address
underlying causes. 

Partners
include
Governor’s
Office/HHR
VDSS
DBHDS
DMAS
OCS
DMAS
DJJ

Providers 
Localities
VLSSE
Faith-based
orgs
Advocacy orgs
Concerned
citizens
Associations
Managed Care


